
A warm welcome to

Historic Inn
Lodging
Wedding & Events

1581 South Washington Ave.
Saginaw, MI 48601

Montague Inn
Bed & Breakfast

www.montagueinn.com

Contact

(989) 752 -3939

www.montagueinn.com

innkeeper@montagueinn.com

Free Parking
Free WiFi

Breakfast included

We are also available on:

Facebook.com/montagueinnbe

Instagram.com/montagueinn

BOOK NOW
Wedding & Event packages:
package.montagueinn.com
Gallery portal: gallery.montagueinn.com
Inquiry or appointment: inquiry.montagueinn.com
Buy ticket for our upcoming events:
ticket.montagueinn.com
Vendor's portal: vendor.montagueinn.com
Learn about our expo: expo.montagueinn.com
Learn about our exhibitions:
exhibition.montagueinn.com
Student opportunities: students.montagueinn.com

https://package.montagueinn.com/
https://gallery.montagueinn.com/
https://inquiry.montagueinn.com/
https://ticket.montagueinn.com/
https://ticket.montagueinn.com/
https://vendor.montagueinn.com/
https://expo.montagueinn.com/
https://exhibition.montagueinn.com/
https://students.montagueinn.com/


Wedding & Events
The Montague Inn will arrange your special party,
wedding, or anniversary with grace & flair. Our
wedding & event packages are highly customizable.
Our unique events each year include the Wedding
expo, Art Exhibition, Mother's Day Buffet, Father's
Day Buffet, and Holiday Christmas Bazaar.

Montague Inn Bed & Breakfast offers a unique and
unforgettable event space in our "Guitar Arena." As
the name suggests, the arena is shaped like a guitar
and offers a one-of-a-kind backdrop for your
special event. The Guitar Arena is perfect for
wedding ceremonies, musical events, and any event
you want to create an unforgettable atmosphere.
The arena can accommodate up to 500 guests,
providing ample space to share your special day
with loved ones and guests.

Experience the beauty and charm of the Montague
Inn while making your event truly memorable. Our
professional and experienced event staff will work
with you to create a flawless event and ensure
every detail is covered.

Overnight Rooms
Experience luxury and comfort in the charming
historic estate of Montague Inn Bed & Breakfast.
Our 16 unique guest rooms are exquisitely
decorated with antique furnishings, providing
guests with a comfortable and luxurious stay. Each
room comes with modern amenities, including air
conditioning, high-speed wireless internet, and a
private bathroom.

Some rooms feature fireplaces, whirlpool tubs, and
private balconies, making for an even more
memorable stay.

Specials
Make your stay at Montague Inn Bed & Breakfast
even more unforgettable with our seasonal special
offers. Take advantage of our 20% discount on all
overnight rooms, available for a limited time only.
Enjoy a longer stay and get the third night for free
when you book two consecutive nights. This special
offer is perfect for those looking to truly relax and
immerse themselves in the historic and luxurious
atmosphere of Montague Inn.


